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On the whole, this was another cool spring with 
winter coat and heater on early mornings well into 
May. We lost a number of days at the beginning of 
April because of wet cold weather. We used the 
same equipment as in previous years, with nets in 
double configurations and remaining in the same 
position as previous year. Some net lanes had to 
have double decking to bring us above the water 
level from previous years. As was the case last year, 
we had 15 species represented by only one 
individual, plus another 19 species having more 
than one and fewer than five individuals. Only 16 
species showed totals of greater than 20 
individuals. It was interesting to note that White­
throated Sparrows had a high date about five days 
earlier than previous years. The pattern of arrival 
was different from last year, with most birds 
coming in a typical bell curve with no earlier peeks. 
On the whole, it was a spring similar to the last four 
years. 

No. Species %SY %ASY %AHY 

186 White-throated Sparrow 70 29 1 

169 Ruby-crowned Kinglet 66 32 22 

95 American Goldfinch 74 14 2 

93 Red-winged Blackbird 68 32 0 

79 Yellow Warbler 84 16* 0 

86 Gray Catbird 58 41 1 

68 Golden-crowned Kinglet 65 35 0 

lis Common Grackle 41 22 37 

65 Magnolia Warbler 55 44 1 

56 Slate-colored Junco 39 60 1 

50 Common Yellowthroat 62 34 4 

* See Comment in narrative 
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Some returns of note were: two Blue Jays banded in 
2000 and obviously still around this year, a Red­
winged Blackbird first banded in 2001, Northern 
Cardinal and Blue Jay banded in 2002, and Gray 
Catbird banded in 2003. We had 309 recaptures 
with 121 from 2008 and 131 from 2009. We allow 
a day for banded birds to clear the area before re­
processing. The numbers would seem to indicate 
that Rock Point is not being used for any long-term 
stops but is being used by returning breeding birds 
as indicated by 2008 totals. 

Foreign recaptures were an American Goldfinch 
recaptured 11 Apr and first banded 23 Nov 2007 by 
Martin Wernaart, St. Williams, ON; and a Herring 
Gull found on the beach by Roswitha Matuschek on 
10 Sep 2008 that had been banded on 8 Jun 2004 on 
Little Cass Island near DeTour Village, MI. 

Recoveries ofRock Point birds were a Gray Catbird 
banded here 8 Oct 2004 and found dead 21 Jul2008 
near the Rock Point Park, and a Gray Catbird 
banded here 2 Oct 2005 and found dead 14 Oct 2005 
in Pensacola, FL. 

The only other scientific work we participated in 
was the color marking of Ruby-throated 
Hummingbirds for the Ontario Humming Bird 
Project. We applied pink acrylic paint to the two 
outer tail feathers. Other colors are being used by 
other Ontario banding stations. Cindy Cartwright 
came and taught us how to color mark the 
hummingbirds. 

Visitors are still welcome at Rock Point and we 
were fortunate in having Ken Perry with us again 
this year for a week in May. Ken brought fellow bird 
bander and trainer John Clarke and, although the 
earlier date meant fewer species, they enjoyed 
themselves. Ken and John are from Ireland and 
hosted Gerda and myself for an unforgettable week 
in Ireland last October. We had double the visitors 
from last year and conducted a successful Migration 
Day on 23 May. 

A grant last year from Ontario Trillium Foundation 
coupled with a $1,000 from Niagara Trailer enabled 
us to purchase our trailer for visiting long-term 
volunteers. 
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Weather was not a major factor during spring 2009. 
We were able to open the nets every day. Although 
we had to close nets for part of 10 days due to rain, 
heavy fog, or wind, we were able to operate for 
more than 500 net-hours more than during any of 
the last five years. Despite being able to run nets 
more than many recent springs, the number ofbirds, 
number of species, and number ofbirds per 100 net­
hours were all only slightly above our spring 
averages. 

Most species captured were within the normal 
range of average spring captures. The few species 
that were outside the range were all higher than 
normal: Tennessee Warbler(2009: 9; average: 2.5 ± 
1.3), Black-and-white Warbler (2009: 164; 

·average: 81.6 ±30.7), and Scarlet Tanager (2009: 
20; average 9.5 ± 4.3). Among our top 10 species, 
most were the same as last year, although in 2008 
the Blackpoll Warbler and Northern Waterthrush 
were among the top ten, while in 2009, those 
species were replaced by the Ovenbird and Black-
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