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HE UPLAND SANDPIPER (BARTRA- rnia Iongicauda) is a shorebird that 
frequents clumps of tall and short 

grass in upland grasslands, prairies, and 
pastures of the Americas. While the 
condition of the breeding grounds is a 
critical component of the reproduction 
ecology of Upland Sandpipers (Mitchell 
1967; White 1983), the wintering 
grounds are equally important to a spe- 
cies' survival (Keast and Morton 1979). 
This article presents recent findings on 
the wintering distribution and migration 
patterns of the Upland Sandpiper--a 
species of declining numbers and en- 
dangered status in some states (Kirsch 
and Higgins 1976; Tate 1981). 

Methods 

To describe more accurately and map 
the wintering range and migration pat- 
terns of the Upland Sandpiper, I have 
searched the literature for published 
records of Bartramia on the wintering 

grounds, requested records of specimens 
collected on the wintering grounds from 
museums in North and South America, 
requested unpublished records of Bar- 
tramia on the wintering grounds from 
ornithologists and birders who have 
traveled in South America, requested 
sightings of Upland Sandpipers from 
South American ornithologists and 
birders through notices in ornithological 
newsletters (A. O.U. Ornithological 
Newsletter, El Volante Migratorio, 
Nuestras Aves), met with Argentine or- 
nithologists and birders, and, visited 
potential wintering areas of Bartramia 
in Argentina. 

These methods present several prob- 
lems. First, published records and un- 
published observations may be incom- 
plete; records may not have a date or 
may include 1ocational information that 
is not specific as to longitude and lati- 
tude. Names given to pinpoint a bird 
sighting, for example, may be of minor 
rivers or small villages not found on 
many maps. The ornithological gazet- 

teers are an aid to finding some of the 
localities, but some observations have 
had to be omitted because of an uncer- 

tainty in the date or location of the 
sighting. I have omitted some 87 records 
of Upland Sandpipers in Latin America 
from the wintering distribution and mi- 
gration maps because of incomplete in- 
formation. 

Second, some reports are detailed, 
but others give only a general area or 
time for a sighting which makes it dif- 
ficult to place on a map; e.g.. "abundant 
in autumn"; "pass through rainy nights 
in February and March." I omitted 
some 15 records in Latin America from 

the wintering distribution and migra- 
tion maps because of too general a de- 
scription for area and time. 

Third, historical changes in range 
must be taken into account. If the dis- 

tribution of Upland Sandpipers on the 
wintering grounds has changed, it may 
be inappropriate to map recent sightings 
with records from the late 1800s. After 

organizing the available records, I des- 
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xgnated hxstoncal sxghtxngs as those prior 
to 1930, and then marked Mstoncal and 
recent sightings with different symbols. 

A fourth problem in preparing a dis- 
tribution map is also temporal but on 
a shorter time scale. There are records 

for Upland Sandpipers in thirteen 
countries in South America, scattered 
throughout most months except June 
and July. Which records should be con- 
sidered to represent wintering birds? I 
have plotted sightings from November, 
December, January, and February, 
treating these months as the wintering 
period. 

A final problem is accounting for 
blank spaces on the map. An accurate 
map of the wintering distribution of 
Upland Sandpipers depends on an in- 
tensive census network in the potential 
range, and because such a data base 
•s not available, blank spaces on the 
map represent uncertainty--how many 
blank spaces represent birds present but 
unobserved? 

Wintering grounds 

Publications on the Upland Sand- 
piper in South America present a 
sketchy picture of the distribution and 
abundance of this species on its winter- 
ing grounds. A description of the win- 
tering range was given by Bent (1929) 
(Fig. 1): 

The main winter range of the 
species is confined to the southern 
part of South America, north to 
northern Argentina (Tucaman); 
and southern Brazil (Irisanga and 
probably Mattodentro). East to 
southern Brazil (probably Matto- 
dentro); Uruguay (Concepcion, 
Sta. Elena, and Colonia); and east- 
ern Argentina (Buenos Aires and 
Rio Negro). South to Argentina 
(Rio Negro). West to Argentina 
(Rio Negro, Mendoza, and Tu- 
cuman). 

Some field guides for South America 
provide slightly more recent but less 
detailed range descriptions--"winters 
•nland chiefly in southern Brazil from 
S•o Paulo south to Uruguay and on 
pampas of Paraguay and Argentina 
south to Rio Negro; a few winter in 
northern South America" (Meyer de 
Schauensee 1970); "winters principally 
•n Paraguay and Argentina. Recently 
found to winter in small numbers in 

Surinam" (Meyer de Schauensee and 
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Phelps 1978), "mxgrates to Rio Negro; 
accxdentally to the Malwnas and South 
Shetland Islands" (Olrog 1968; and Ol- 
rog 1984). The A.O.U. (1983) describes 
the wintering distribution as "from Su- 
rinam and northern Brazil south to 

central Argentina and Uruguay." The 
most detailed description remains that 
of Bent (1929), although population 
declines of the bird may render his ac- 
count inaccurate today. 

Accounts of the abundance of Up- 
land Sandpipers in South America, even 
those of 60 years ago, are contradictory. 
Dabbene (1920) and Hudson (1920) 
described the bird as widely and evenly 
distributed over the pampas of Argen- 
tina. In contrast, Wetmore (1927) 
warned that the bird, "formerly very 
abundant," was present in reduced 
numbers, and claimed that, due to 
hunting "Those that remain must seek 
the pastures of remote estancias 
[ranches] in order to survive." 

Since 1927, only one brief note (O1- 
rog 1967), has been published regarding 
population fluctuations of the Upland 
Sandpiper on its wintering grounds. 
From 1958 to 1962, Olrog surveyed 
migrant birds in the Buenos Aires 
Province of Argentina. He attributed a 
decline in the numbers of most migrants 

to the modernization of farms, drmmng, 
and drought. Several shorebird species 
appeared to be as abundant as in the 
1920s but the Upland Sandpiper, de- 
scribed as one of the most characteristic 

birds of this region in 1920, was scarce 
and "in danger of becoming very rare." 

Recent observations from ornithol- 

ogists continue, in general, to support 
Olrog's concern. M. Rumboll •ers. 
comm.) reports only three sightings of 
the species in Argentina in 14 years 
(1968-1982); J.P. Myers (pers. comm ), 
in his 18 months of field work in south- 

eastern Buenos Aires province (1973- 
1974), did not see a single Upland 
Sandpiper; R. Ridsely (pers. comm.) has 
several scattered sightings of the b•rd 
from his study area in southern Brazil 
in 1980 and 1981, one sighting from 
Paraguay in 1982, several from Bolivia, 
and only one from northeastern Argen- 
tina in 1982. He calls the winterms 
grounds of this species "a mystery." In 
contrast, O. S. Pettingill (pers. comm ), 
observed up to 20 birds in one of two 
different sightings in northeastern Ar- 
gentina in 1969 and believes that "the 
Upland Sandpiper is among several of 
our other North American shoreb•rds 

that winter in Argentina very com- 
monly." 

Figure 1. Wintering range of the Upland Sandpiper as described by Bent (1929). 
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OSouth Shetland Islands 

A new map provides the best avail- 
able picture of the Upland Sandpiper's 
wintering range (Fig. 2). Out of 318 rec- 
ords of Upland Sandpipers in Latin 
America, I used 105 sightings from No- 
vember, December, January, and Feb- 
ruary to construct this map. In addition 
to authors cited in the text, other sources 
for published records include the fol- 
lowing: Ridgway 1919; Beatty 1938; 
Hellmayr and Conover 1948; Howell 
1964; Monroe 1968; Land 1970; Karr 
1976; and Spaans 1978. Sightings of 
Upland Sandpipers in these months are 
uncommon, but are strongly concen- 
trated in the area usually identified as 
the species' wintering area in Argentina 
and Uruguay. The records also show 
that the Upland Sandpiper was ob- 
served more often in the Province of 

Buenos Aires and in Uruguay before 
1930; since then, the species has appar- 
ently declined in that area. In contrast, 
records of Upland Sandpipers after 
1930 increase north and slightly west of 
Buenos Aires. 

In January 1985, I spent one month 
in northern and central Argentina in 
search of Upland Sandpiper wintering 
sites. I found three areas with Upland 

Historical: 1 recordo ; 

5 recordsO Figure2. Wintering Recent: 1 record ß; 
5 records ß distribution of the 

Upland Sandpiper. 

Sandpipers--in the provinces of Entre 
Rios, Corrientes and C6rdoba. A total 
of 80 birds was counted for the three 
locations. 

Outside of Argentina and Uruguay, 
wintering birds seem rare. Hayer- 
schmidt (1966) describes Upland Sand- 
pipers wintering in Surinam as "regu- 
larly present in small flocks." Specimens 
were collected periodically from Octo- 
ber 1965 through April 1966, to docu- 
ment wintering birds, but no thorough 
study has been conducted of numbers 

present in this area. The only other 
countries in South America with at least 

three records of Upland Sandpipers in 
November, December, January, or 
February are Brazil, Paraguay, and 
Venezuela. These birds may be over- 
wintering in these countries, but they 
may also represent late migrants. 

Discussion 

The map in Figure 2 portrays two 
features that deserve discussion: the 

small number of sightings and the ap- 
parent change in wintering distribution. 

Several factors likely contribute to 
keeping the population low and the 
range restricted. The Upland Sandpiper 
is protected by law in Argentina, but 
hunting laws are not strictly enforced 
either on the national level or among 
provinces and landowners (Figs. 3 and 
4). This lack of protection led Olrog, as 
late as 1967, to keep secret the location 
of several Upland Sandpipers to protect 
them from hunters. Landholdings are 
large in some parts of the Argentine 
pampas and regulation may be based 
on the discretion of landowners, or of 
local managers for absentee landowners. 
Some may not care what is hunted on 
their land; others may hunt themselves. 
All Argentine ornithologists, however, 
when questioned, were quick to disre- 
gard hunting of this species as a possi- 
bility; they stated that other problems 
on the wintering and breeding grounds 
(pesticides and habitat loss) were more 
critical factors in Upland Sandpiper 
survival. 

Predators, other than human, on the 
wintering grounds do not seem to pose 
a threat. Mammalian predators that 
might take a bird 30 centimeters tall are 

Figure 3. Upland Sandpiper habitat in South America: Cattle and windmill on Argentine 
estancia. 
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not abundant in the grasslands. Rum- 
boll (pers. comm.) states that foxes are 
not abundant, and that weasels, opos- 
sums, and other small mammals could 

take a sandpiper only if it were injured 
or roosting (Fig. 5). Similarly, the num- 
ber of adult Upland Sandpipers taken 
by birds of prey is not considered large 
(R. Fraga, M. Rumboll, S. Salvador, 
pers. comm.). 

Lack of space or scarce food resources 
could be a problem for wintering sand- 
pipers. Myers (1979) discusses the lim- 
ited space available for shorebirds win- 
tering in southern South America, 
comparing land mass at similar lati- 
tudes on the two continents: "The ex- 

tent of winter scolopacid habitat in 
south temperate areas is small relative 
to the area used during breeding, and 
this induces very high densities in win- 
tering populations." He describes ag- 
gressive encounters between North and 
South American shorebirds and sug- 
gests that there is competition for lim- 
ited resources. 

On my visit to Argentina, I observed 
only one other shorebird--the Southern 
Lapwing (Vanellus chilensis)--feeding 
in close proximity to Upland Sandpip- 
ers. Myers (1979) describes this lapwing 
as an extremely aggressive species that 
attacks ferociously if other birds come 
close to its chicks, probably a response 
to limited food resources. On several 
occasions I did observe the Southern 

Lapwing chase Upland Sandpipers, 
suggesting support for Myers' statement 
on aggressive behavior of the lapwing 
and possible competition for food re- 
sources. 

A competitive interaction between 
Upland Sandpipers and Southern 

Lapwings, however, is not well accepted 
among several Argentine ornithologists 
(R. Fraga, S. Salvador, pers. comm.). 
First, the lapwing is often found in short 
heavily grazed pastures in contrast to 
the mixed short- and tall-grass areas 
most commonly used by Upland Sand- 
pipers (Fig. 6). Second, food resources 
seem abundant on the pampas. Al- 
though a quantitative study of food 
abundance is not available, in the Villa 
Maria area, where the largest known 
concentration of Upland Sandpipers 
winters in Argentina, the field appeared 
to abound in grasshoppers; insects, in- 
cluding grasshoppers, crickets, and 
weevils, are described as the primary 
food of this species (McAtee and Beal 
1912; Fig. 7). 

Land-use practices that affect Upland 
Sandpipers on the wintering grounds 
are not well documented. Several Ar- 

gentine ornithologists, when questioned 
about causes for Upland Sandpipers 
decline, quickly suggested the use of 
pesticides. Insecticides were sprayed 
heavily in the 1940s to eradicate locusts, 
and several authors (Barrows 1884; 
Durnford 1877; Dabbene 1920) re- 
ported that the birds ate large quantities 
of these insects. While pesticide use has 
been correlated with eggshell thinning 
in several carnivorous marine birds and 

in birds of prey, and with mortality in 
several songbird populations (Hickey 
1961), there is no documentation of 
pesticide damage to Upland Sandpipers 
on their breeding or wintering grounds. 

Changes in agricultural practices may 
be critical to the Upland Sandpiper's 
limited numbers and to its suggested 
change in wintering occurrence. The 
modernization of farms, draining, and 

Figure 4. Upland Sandpipers in wintering habitat: Argentine gaucho 
in background. 

drought mentioned earlier (Olrog 1967), 
may account for a decline of Upland 
Sandpipers in the province of Buenos 
Aires. In addition, these practices may 
help explain the apparent shift of the 
wintering range to areas slightly north- 
west and north into the provinces of 
Ctrdoba, Santa Fe, Entre Rios, and 
Corfientes. Birds may also have moved 
farther north to Uruguay, southern 
Brazil, Paraguay, and Bolivia--areas 
that have not been thoroughly surveyed 
but in which there have been several 

recent sightings. 
Favorable changes in these northern 

and northwestern areas of Argentina 
may serve to attract the species. The 
province of Ctrdoba, which has reports 
of the most numbers of Upland Sand- 
pipers to date, was originally espinal, or 
an area of short, scrubby trees (genus 
Prosopis) with a slightly drier climate 
and sandiet soils than in the Buenos 

Aires Province (Cabrera and Willink 
1973; Fig. 8, this paper). The central 
portion of the espinal belt has been 
cleared for dairy farms and is mainly in 
pasture and alfalfa. The Upland Sand- 
piper is said to prefer the drier climate 
and planted grasses, which do well on 
the sandy soil, to the wetter area with 
coarser native grasses farther south and 
southeast (R. Fraga and S. Salvador, 
pers. comm.). All three locations where 
I observed Bartramia in January 1985 
were in this espinal region. 

Migration patterns 

Important stopover areas of migrat- 
ing Upland Sandpiper have not been 
identified. Bent (1929), however, pro- 

Figure 5. Upland Sandpipers are wary on the wintering grounds and 
not easy prey to predators. 
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Figure 6. Upland Sandpipers feeding among dumps of tall and short 
grass. 

vides the most detailed notes available 

on general migration routes of this spe- 
cies. He states that the bird "is not re- 

corded east of Cuba in the spring, but 
some birds migrate across from Yuca- 
tan to Cuba and Florida and then up 
the Atlantic Coast." Fall migration is 
described as "southward, through the 
interior and the Atlantic Coast States 

and through the West Indies to South 
America." The A.O.U. (1983)provides 
a more recent summary of the route-- 
"migrates south through North Amer- 
ica (rare along Pacific coast from south- 
ern Alaska to Washington casually to 
California, and rare in Arizona, Nova 
Scotia and the south Atlantic coastal 

region), Middle America (not reported 
northwestern Mexico), the West Indies 
and most of South America (also To- 
bago and Trinidad) east of the Andes." 

I have constructed maps of the Up- 
land Sandpiper's migration patterns 
using methods described earlier (Figs. 9 
and 10). I used 65 sightings from March, 
April, and May for the Spring map and 
148 sightings from August, September, 
and October for the fall map. These 
maps confirm descriptions given by 
Bent (1929) and the A.O.U. (1983) but 
several additional observations can be 
made. 

There are fewer spring than fall rec- 
ords for migrating Upland Sandpipers. 
Wetmore (1965) describes Upland 
Sandpipers as found less commonly in 
the spring migration in Panama. 
Ridgely (1981) also states that the bird 
in Panama is an "uncommon to fairly 
common fall and rather rare spring 
transient .... "Spring records for the 
West Indies are rare. It appears that the 
birds travel south across the Caribbean 

as well as through Central America in 

Figure 7. Upland 
Sandpiper feeding 

on the wintering 
grounds. 
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Figure 8. Biogeographical provinces of •4rgentina: Espinal and pampa (after Cabrera and 
Willink 1979) 
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Historical: 1 record o ; 5 records O 
Recent: 1 record ß ; 5 recordsß 

F•gure 9, Spring migration patterns of the Upland Sandpipe• 

fall but fly north only through Central 
America in spring, although the small 
number of spring records from Panama 
is perplexing. Perhaps there are fewer 
bird observers and collectors, and thus 
fewer reports of Upland Sandpipers, in 
the West Indies and Central America 
in the spring than in fall. 

The length of the migration period 
appears to extend over three or four 
months in fall and in spring. Records 
of South American specimens and 
sightings are scattered throughout South 
America from August through May. 
While some birds may undertake a 
fairly rapid flight between the breeding 
and wintering grounds, there also ap- 
pear to be birds that linger in Central 
and northern Southern America; mi- 
gratory stopovers may be lengthy and 
birds may spend as little as two months 
on the actual wintering grounds. This 
is suggested by records of birds in Pan- 
ama and Peru in November, and in 
Venezuela in November and Decem- 

ber. Neither wintering or the year-round 
presence of Upland Sandpipers has been 
documented in these countries. 

This extended length of travel along 
the migration route emphasizes the 
need to preserve inland and upland 
shorebird habitat used by Upland 
Sandpipers, not only on the breeding 
and wintering grounds, but through the 
Western Hemisphere. 

Figure 10. Fall migration patterns of the Upland Sandpiper. 

Historical: 1 record o; 5 records O 
Recent: 1 record e; 5 records ß 

Conclusion 

Any combination of the possible 
causes discussed previously--hunting, 
predators, interspecific competition, 
pesticides, and land-use change--may 
account for the apparent decline in Up- 
land Sandpiper numbers. An important 
basic question that must be addressed, 
however, is how rare is Bartrarnia on 
its traditional wintering grounds? On 
my brief trip to Argentina, I found birds 
in places and in numbers (but still very 
few) of which local landowners and or- 
nithologists were not aware. In fact, I 
found more birds in several locations 

in the four weeks I was in Argentina 
than many ornithologists had seen in 
the past 10 to 15 years. What about ad- 
jacent ranches and landholdings? Are 
Upland Sandpipers present there, an 
apparenfiy similar habitat? How many 
of the roadless or inaccessible ranches 
are searched for upland shoreb•rds? 
Very few of the birding hotspots in Ar- 
gentina--Iguazfi Falls, Barlioche, Pe- 
ninsula Valdes--include grassland 
habitat and thus are not hotspots for 
Upland Sandpipers. In addition, very 
few of the potential wintering sites an 
other South American countries-- 
Uruguay, southern Brazil, Paraguay and 
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Bohvla--are blrded intensely in poten- 
Ual Upland Sandpiper wlntenng habi- 
tat 

Further study on the wintering dis- 
tnbution of Bartramia in South Amer- 

ma requires an intensive system of cen- 
suslng. Owners of large landholdings 
should be contacted for knowledge of 
the presence of the bird, and for per- 
mission to search their land. The grass- 
land provinces of Argentina should 
serve as the initial search area with ad- 

dmonal census work in Uruguay, 
southern Brazil, Paraguay and Bolivia. 
Only by looking for this bird will we 
know where it winters. Once major 
w•ntering sites are identified the causes 
and extent of wintering mortality can 
be studied and documented. 
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