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A Complete Checklist of the Birds of the World.- 
Richard Howard and Alick Moore. 1980. Oxford Uni- 
versity Press, New York. 701 p. $49.50. For most 
families of birds, the ultimate authority on taxonomy, 
nomenclature, and distribution is the 15-volume 
Check-list of Birds of the World started by the late J. 
L. Peters and continued under several editors. Birders 
and most non-curatorial ornithologists, however, are 
content with a simpler reference, and indeed would 
prefer to have it as an affordable single volume. Several 
such works have been produced in recent years, among 
them those by Gruson and Forster (see Condor 
78:279), Morony, Bock, and Farrand (see Condor 
77:521), and Walters (see Condor 82:141). Here is yet 
another, perhaps overall the most useful one of the lot. 
It lists all living species of birds down to subspecific 
level and gives, briefly, the range of each subspecies. 
References are given for each family or subfamily, 
often in considerable numbers, inspiring confidence in 
the authors’ ability to find their way through taxonomic 
jungles. Good typography and layout make for easy leg- 
ibility, but one should watch for occasional misspell- 
ings. The index is a great asset because it includes 
specific names. 

Edward Lear’s Birds.-Susan Hyman. 1980. William 
Morrow and Co., New York. 96 p. $37.95. Lear’s artistic 
career has been overshadowed by his popularity as the 
author and illustrator of limericks and nonsense verse. 
A painter and lithographer, he contributed illustrations 
to many zoological works, including the monographs 
of John Gould. Thanks to his talent and significant in- 
novations, he became one of the finest and most im- 
portant bird artists in European culture. This side of 
his life is the subject of the present book. A handsome, 
oversize volume, it provides a long biographical essay, 
concentrating on Lear’s career as a naturalist and artist. 
It is lavishly illustrated, not only with bird plates, but 
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also drawings for limericks and nonsense-one can 
hardly believe that the same man did both, their styles 
are so different. The color reproduction is first-rate. 
This book should be seen by those who enjoy fine bird 
art or study its history. Bibliography, index. 

Atlas of Breeding Birds of the London Area.-ed- 
ited by David J. Montier. 1977. Batsford, North Pom- 
fret, VT. 288 p. $57.00. The summer distribution of all 
breeding birds in the London Area was mapped (on a 
2 x 2 km grid) by a large corps of birders in a five-year 
project organized by the London Natural History So- 
ciety. The results of that uniquely intensive survey are 
presented here. Each of the 120 species found is de- 
voted a full-page map and page of text that discusses 
past and present breeding status and distribution. All 
phases of the project appear to have been carried out 
carefully and thoroughly. While this volume will chief- 
ly interest those who had a hand in the work, it should 
be seen as a model for similar surveys elsewhere. Ap- 
pendixes, references, indexes. 

Birds of Karkar and Bagabag Islands, New Guinea.- 
Jared M. Diamond and Mary LeCroy. 1979. Bulletin 
of the American Museum of Natural History, Vol. 164, 
Art. 4. New York. 65 p. Paper cover. $4.30. Karkar and 
Bagabag are volcanic islands off the northeast coast of 
New Guinea. They “have been colonized by a very 
nonrandom sample of the New Guinea and Bismarck 
[Archipelago] avifaunas, and therefore afford an op- 
portunity to obtain insight into the general problem of 
species differences in colonizing ability.” This report 
first discusses the zoogeographic origin, species com- 
position, species turnover, niche shifts, and other gen- 
eral features of the avifaunas. Species accounts then 
give measurements, information on habits, and re- 
marks on taxonomy. The study is a valuable contribu- 
tion to the ornithology of New Guinea. References. 
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range within the avifaunal zones of West Africa is also 
given. This book will be indispensable for birders in 
the region and may persuade more of them to visit 
there. Many maps and photographs, references, index. 
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Department of Zoology, Brigham Young University, 
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The Breeding Seasons of East African Birds.-L. H. 
Brown and P. L. Britton. 1980. The East Africa Natural 
History Society, Nairobi. 164 p. $15.00. Source: Sec- 
retary, E.A.N.H.S., P.O. Box 44486, Nairobi, Kenya. 
This monograph “attempts to bring together all that is 
known, to date, of the breeding seasons of East African 
birds, and to relate these, so far as possible, to the cli- 
matic factors (especially rainfall) controlling scarcity or 
abundance and seasonal changes of various foods.” 
After a thorough introduction, there follows a system- 
atic list of the species for which indicative or definite 
breeding records could be found. Given for each 
species is a summary and analysis of the records as far 
as they permit. The compilation of these data is an 
enormous accomplishment. In a long and meaty essay, 
the authors then discuss the factors affecting the breed- 
ing seasons of these birds and the seasonal availability 
of food. While the annotated list will be of use only to 
ornithologists working in East Africa, the discussion 
should be of wide interest to students of reproduction 
ecology. Maps, graphs, references. 
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RECENT PUBLICATIONS 

Woodpeckers and the Southern Pine Beetle.- 
James C. Kroll, Richard N. Conner, and Robert R. 
Fleet. [1980]. Agriculture Handbook 564, U.S. Dept. of 
Agriculture. 23 p. Paper cover. Source: Supt. of Doc- 
uments, U.S. Govt. Printing Office, Washington, D.C. 
20402. Four species of woodpeckers are important 
predators of the southern pine beetle, which in turn 
attacks all species of southern pines. This booket de- 
scribes the pertinent ecology of the birds and the bee- 
tle, and suggests forest management practices that 
would favor woodpecker populations. The use of birds 
as biological control agents and the consideration of 
non-game species in forest management represents a 
commendable new approach in forestry. 

Relationships between hummingbirds and flowers 
in the Andes of Colombia.-David W. Snow and Bar- 
bara K. Snow. 1980. Bulletin of the British Museum 
(Natural History), Zoology series, Vol. 38, No. 2, 34 p. 
Paper cover. f 5. Source: Publications, British Museum 
(N.H.), Cromwell Road, London SW7 5BD, U.K. This 
is a research report on the feeding ecology of hum- 
mingbirds in the subtropical and temperate forests of 
the Andes, where the greatest number and variety of 
species coexist. After presenting their observations at 
each of three study areas, the authors discuss ornitho- 
phily, coevolution between hummingbirds and flow- 
ers, and the foraging habits of hummingbirds. The ar- 
ticle offers data and ideas in abundance. References. 

Evolution of Social Behavior: Hypotheses and Em- 
pirical Tests .-edited by Hubert Markl. 1980. Dahlem 
Workshop Reports, Life Sciences Research Report No. 

in the Black-headed Gull (Larms t-i&bun&s). Ibis 
107:433459. 

PEARSON, T. H. 1968. The feeding biology of sea-bird 
species breeding on the Farne Islands, Northum- 
berland. J. Anim. Ecol. 37:521-552. 

RYDER, J. P. 1975. Egg-laying, egg-size and success 
in relation to immature-mature plumage of Ring- 
billed Gulls. Wilson Bull. 87:534-542. 

RYDER, J. P., AND T. R. CARROLL. 1978. Reproductive 
success of Herring Gulls on Granite Island, north- 
ern Lake Superior, 1975 and 1976. Can. Field-Nat. 
92:51-54. 

RYDER, J. P., AND L. SOMPPI. 1977. Growth and de- 
velopment of known-age Ring-billed Gull em- 
bryos. Wilson Bull. 89:243-252. 

RYDER, J. P., AND L. SOMPPI. 1979. Female-female 
pairing in Ring-billed Gulls. Auk 96:1-5. 

TENAZA, R. 1971. Behavior and nesting success rela- 
tive to nest location in Adelie Penguins (Pygos- 
celis adeliae). Condor 73:81-92. 

Department of Biology, Lakehead University, Thunder 
Bay, Ontario, Canada P7B 5EI. Accepted for publi- 
cation 3 June 1980. 

18, Verlag Chemie, Weinheim. 255 p. Paper cover. 
$22.50. Source: Verlag Chemie Int., Plaza Centre, 
Suite E, 1020 N. W. 6th St., Deerfield Beach, FL 33441. 
Here are the proceedings of a workshop on the evo- 
lution of sociality in animals, held in Berlin in 1980. 
Nine formal papers are followed by four group reports: 
Methodology and sociobiology modelling, mecha- 
nisms of kin-correlated behavior, measuring fitness in 
social systems, and genetics and social behavior. On 
the one hand are the views of theoreticians and spe- 
cialists in mathematical modelling, while on the other 
are those of students of animal behavior in the labo- 
ratory or the field. Although only one of the papers 
specifically concerns birds, the volume offers many 
ideas of interest to avian sociologists. The book can be 
considered a state-of-the-art report, thanks to the em- 
inence of its contributors and the alacrity with which 
it was published. References, limericks, and indexes. 

Behavioral Mechanisms in Ecology.-Douglass H. 
Morse. 1980. Harvard University Press, Cambridge, 
Mass. 383 p. $25.00. This is a textbook “about the re- 
lationships of animals to their resources and about their 
relationships to one another through those resources.” 
In order, it considers foraging efficiency and econom- 
ics, habitat selection, avoiding predation, behavioral 
thermoregulation, reproduction, competition of differ- 
ent kinds, and sociality. Birds are used for many ex- 
amples, their behavioral ecology being among the 
most-studied of all animals. The writing is admirably 
clear, a notable accomplishment in a field where much 
of it is not. Most chapters contain a concluding synthe- 
sis and the last chapter itself indicates future directions 
for research. Graphs, references, index. 
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EMBRYONIC DOUBLE MONSTER IN 
THE WEDGE-TAILED SHEARWATER 

TED N. PETTIT 

AND 

G. CAUSEY WHITTOW 

During a study of embryonic respiration in the Wedge- 
tailed Shearwater (Puffinus pac$cus), an egg was col- 
lected and found to contain an embryonic duplicitas: 
a double monster or Siamese twin. This egg was col- 
lected on 7 August 1979 from Manana Island, Oahu, 
Hawaii and was 40 ‘_ 1 days old; the incubation period 
for this species averages 52 days. After respiratory data 
had been obtained, the egg was dissected and a dou- 
ble-monster embryo was found inside. The body of the 
embryo was completely duplicated except for a com- 
mon head with one eye absent and the brain exposed 
on the left side. This embryo conformed to Ulshafer 
and Clavert’s (J. Embryol. Exp. Morphol. 53:237-243, 
1979) Group I classification of avian double monsters. 
The yolk-free mass of the abnormal embryo (10.3 g) 
equalled 47% of the yolk-free mass of normally devel- 
oped shearwater embryos of the same age. 
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RECENT PUBLICATIONS 

The Great Gray Owl/Phantom of the Northern For- 
est.-Robert W. Nero, photographs by Robert R. Tay- 
lor. 1980. Smithsonian Institution Press, Washington 
D.C. 167 p. $17.50. For ten years, Nero and his col- 
leagues have been pursuing and watching Great Gray 
Owls in the spruce-tamarack bogs of Manitoba and ad- 
jacent Minnesota. Coupling his observations with pub- 
lished findings, he presents here a good basic account 
of the natural history of his subject and its world. Its 
feeding, breeding behavior, and other habits are por- 
trayed with much new information gained from inti- 
mate studies. At the same time, he tells of his experi- 
ences and feelings while hunting the hunter. Taylor’s 
photographs are remarkably good, whether they are in- 
tended to be didactic or poetic, they complement, not 
simply illustrate, the text. One of the few books de- 
voted to a single species of owl, this highly readable 
work should appeal to all those who like owls. Refer- 
ences, index. 

An Annotated Bibliography of Bald and Golden 
Eagles in Washington.-G. T. Allen, R. L. Knight, and 
M. V. Stalmaster. 1980. Washington Dept. of Game. 66 
p. Paper cover. Source: Washington Dept. of Game, 
600 North Capitol Way, Olympia, Wash. 98504. This 
catalog attempts to include all publications that refer, 

The incidence of malformation in Wedge-tailed 
Shearwaters is difficult to assess but in 170 eggs we 
have examined over a three-year period, this is the first 
embryonic anomaly found. This would place the inci- 
dence of malformation at 0.59%. Romanoff (Pathogen- 
esis of the avian embryo, John Wiley and Sons, 1972) 
reported values of 0.8% to 0.06% for embryonic dupli- 
citas in chicken eggs. In ducks the phenomenon is 
more common: about 2% of all fertilized eggs form 
double monsters. The effect is believed to be caused 
by changes in orientation of the egg within the shell 
gland during the critical period of symmetrization, re- 
sulting in the formation of two organizing centers (Ul- 
Shafer and Clavert 1979). Other teratogenic factors may 
include high levels of pesticides and mercury. Fisher 
(Pac. Sci. 27:220-225,1973) reported high levels of tox- 
ic substances in the Laysan Albatross (Diomedea im- 
mutabilis) on Midway Atoll but we know of no such 
studies on other procellariiform birds. 

This study was supported in part by the National 
Science Foundation (Grant #PCM-12351-A01 to G. 
Causey Whittow) and the Leahi Trust Fund, Research 
Corporation of the University of Hawaii (Grant #1979 
to Ted N. Pettit). 

Department of Physiology, John A. Burns School of 
Medicine, University of Hawaii, Honolulu, Hawaii 
96822. Accepted for publication 15 October 1980. 

however slightly, to eagles in the State of Washington. 
It also offers a list of selected articles on Bald or Gold- 
en eagles in which the research was conducted else- 
where. The bibliography appears very comprehensive, 
yet not significantly more useful than those by Lincer, 
Clark, and LeFranc (1979. Noted in Condor 81:257) 
and by Knight (1979. Noted in Condor 82:290). Eagle 
biologists in Washington, Oregon, and British Colum- 
bia who may not have the latter work should get this 
one instead. 

The Common Raven.-Richard L. Knight and Mayo 
W. Call. 1980. Technical Note #344, U.S. Dept. of the 
Interior, Bureau of Land Management. 61 p. Paper cov- 
er. Source: DSC, Federal Center Building 50, Denver, 
CO 80225. This report, apparently intended for BLM 
biologists, provides well-organized information on the 
populations, life history, and ecology of the Common 
Raven. Coverage is largely restricted to North America, 
although this is not stated. Brief chapters also give 
management recommendations, research methods, and 
a partial list of current investigations on the species. 
Findings have been studiously compiled from the lit- 
erature without synthesis, critical evaluation, or inter- 
pretation. Errors exist at least in the sections on tax- 
onomy and distribution, Photographs, references. 
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NEWS AND NOTES RECENT PUBLICATIONS 

FRANK M. CHAPMAN FUND 

The Frank M. Chapman Memorial Fund gives grants 
in aid for ornithological research and also post-doctoral 
fellowships. While there is no restriction on who may 
apply, the Committee particularly welcomes and favors 
applications from graduate students; projects in game 
management and the medical sciences are seldom 
funded. Applications are due on 15 September and 15 
February. Information on form and content of appli- 
cations may be obtained from the Frank M. Chapman 
Memorial Fund Committee, The American Museum of 
Natural History, Central Park West at 79th Street, New 
York, N.Y. 10024. 

TRANSLATIONS OF WATERBIRD RESEARCH 

The Pacific Seabird Group is compiling translations of 
foreign research on seabirds, shorebirds, and water- 
fowl. In order to aid researchers and prevent unwitting 
duplication of effort, we request all ornithologists who 
have translations to contact us. Originals sent to us will 
be copied and returned; copies will be deposited in 
the Josselyn van Tyne Memorial Library of the Wilson 
Ornithological Society for the use of all researchers. 
All translations sent will be cited in the PSG Bulletin. 
For more information, please contact: Douglas Siegel- 
Causey, PSG Committee on Foreign Research, Dept. 
of Ecology, University of Arizona, Tucson, Arizona 
85721. 
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THE BULLETIN BOARD 

WANTED: Surplus bird skins and skeletal materials 
(worldwide) to supplement a small but growing col- 
lection at the UNCC Zoological Museum. Please con- 
tact Richard D. Brown, Curator, Department of Biolo- 
gy, University of North Carolina at Charlotte, Charlotte, 
NC 28223. 

WANTED: A Guide to the Birds of South Americu, 
by R. Meyer de Schauensee (1970). Victor Emanuel, 
P.O. Box 4429, Austin TX 78765. 

WANTED: Life Histories of Central American Birds, 
Vol. 1, by Alexander Skutch (1954). Please send name, 
address, and asking price to Bob Righter, 1020-15th, 
Denver, CO 80202. 

The Peregrine Falcon.-Derek Ratcliffe. 1980. Buteo 
Books. Vermillion, South Dakota. 420 p. $42.50. Writ- 
ten by an authority, this is a book about the natural 
history of the peregrine, mainly in Great Britain. As- 
pects of its habits as studied elsewhere are referred to, 
but the work is not intended as a comprehensive treat- 
ment of the species. On the contrary, British peregrines 
are examined in detail with regard to their populations 
and distribution, food and feeding habits, breeding, 
population regulation, and other aspects of their ecol- 
ogy. An especially valuable chapter recounts the pes- 
ticide story, in which Ratcliffe played an important 
part. In closing, he discusses conservation and the fu- 
ture of peregrines. The book is well organized and 
written in a clear, non-technical style. It is furnished 
with color paintings and black-and-white drawings by 
Donald Watson, and many photographs. Despite its 
limited scope, this book should be of wide and intense 
interest to all those who study or keep falcons. Graphs, 
many tables of data, references, index. 

The Crows/A Study of the Corvids of Europe.- 
Franklin Coombs. [1978]. Batsford, North Pomfret, 
Vermont. 255 p. $35.00. The author of this book has 
studied rooks and their allies in England and on the 
Continent for more than forty years. He describes here 
the habits of the eleven species of European corvids, 
drawing extensively on the literature as well as his own 
observations. Each species is treated as far as known 
about its appearance, distribution, behavior, voice, ter- 
ritoriality, nesting, food, predators, and mortality. A re- 
grettably brief chapter makes some comparisons 
among these species. In closing, Coombs offers ex- 
tracts from the journal of Lewis Harding, whose study 
of the rook, made in Cornwall in 1847-8, was perhaps 
the first intensive study of any single species of bird. 
The book is made attractive by maps, photographs, pen 
drawings, and four fine color plates, all by the author. 
This is a valuable source book on corvid biology, es- 
pecially for its information and illustrations of their 
postures. References, table of measurements, index, 

Birds of Regina. Revised edition.-Margaret Belch- 
er. 1980. Special Publication No. 12, Saskatchewan 
Natural History Society, Regina, Sask. 151 p. Paper 
cover. $5.00 plus 50’ postage. Source: Blue Jay Book- 
shop, Box 1121, Regina, Sask. S4P 3B4, This is an an- 
notated checklist of the birds recorded in the vicinity 
of Regina, completely revised and updated from the 
first edition (1961). The species accounts give the sta- 
tus, habitat and occurrence, including important rec- 
ords. A carefully prepared and useful reference for 
birders in its region. Photographs, sketches by F. W. 
Lahrman, references, index. 

FOR SALE: Iowa Bird Life, Vols. 32 (1962) through Birds of the Qu’Appelle, 1857-1979.-E. Manley 
39 (1979). Make offer. Richard L. Knight, Washington Callin. [1980]. Special Publication No. 13, Saskatche- 
Eagle Study, Washington Department of Game, 600 N. wan Natural History Society, Regina, Sask. 168 p. Pa- 
Capitol Way, Olympia WA 98504. per cover. $7.00 plus SO* postage. Source: as above. 
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This book treats the birdlife in the eastern half of the 
Qu’Appelle Valley, from a short distance east of Regina 
to the Manitoba border. The region’s ornithological 
history spans 124 years, a remarkably high percentage 
of its residents having become interested in birds and 
kept records. The species accounts are based on rec- 
ords by the author and his brother, and supplemented 
by those of other observers. They give the status, lo- 
calities, and occurrence, including dates of migration 
and nesting. While chiefly of value to birders in its 
region, the book may have wider interest because it 
documents changes in birdlife over an unusually long 
period. Maps, photographs, references, index. 

Nature SaskatooniAn Account of the Saskatoon 
Natural History Society 1955-1980.-C. Stuart 
Houston. 1980. Saskatoon Natural History Society, Re- 
gina, Sask. 46 p. Paper cover. $2.50 plus 5Oe postage. 
Source: as above. This history was prepared for the 
25th anniversary of the S.N.H.S. Chapters cover the 
organization and activities of the Society, its contri- 
butions to scientific knowledge and local conservation, 
and its leading deceased members. The booklet will 
be meaningful for the Society’s members and should 
encourage similar organizations to compile their own 
histories. 
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