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mynas, and the parrots--that have unmelodious 
harsh voices, intimate social attachments (in•Iuding 
the attachment to man as a substitute conspecific), 
and a remarkable versatility in copying foreign 
sounds. It is possible that the brief, noise-like vocal- 
izations of such birds, including the House Sparrow, 
are compressed melodies that may contain many 
characteristics of a melody except its sequential ar- 
rangement. 

I thank L. F. Baptista, A.M. Dufty, Jr., and D. 
Schmidl for valuable comments. 
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Nest-sharing by a Lark Sparrow 
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Both the Lark Sparrow (Chondestes grammacus) and 
the-Mockingbird (Mimus polyglottos) commonly nest 
in weedy fields, grasslands with scattered trees and 
bushes, pastures, and prairies. During a study of 
Lark Sparrow nesting behavior, a nest was observed 
that was shared by both species. The nest was lo- 
cated 2.2 m above the ground in an eastern red cedar 
tree (Juniperus virginiana) in Willis Cemetery on 
Highway 99 near Willis, Oklahoma. The cemetery 
consists of 4 ha of grasses beneath a 30% cover of 
ornamental trees and shrubs. 

When first discovered on 15 June 1981, the nest 
consisted only of a base of twigs. On the same day, 
two Lark Sparrows were observed copulating on a 
nearby grave marker. On 16 June, the Lark Sparrows 
were observed to make 13 attempts at building the 
nest, but a Mockingbird interfered with the build- 
ing. Bent (1968) nQted a similar example of interfer- 
ence in this same area in 1957 when a Lark Sparrow 
attempted to build near an active Mockingbird nest. 

Whenever a sparrow approached the nest with 
building material, the Mockingbird would fly to the 
nest and chase the sparrow to the ground. On 18 
June, the nest was completed, with a cup composed 
primarily of horse hair, and it contained one Mock- 
ingbird egg and one Lark Sparrow egg. The Mock- 
ingbird egg was pale blue with dark splotches, while 
the Lark Sparrow egg was cream-colored with dark 
brown scrawl markings on the blunt end of the egg. 
On 19 June, another Mockingbird egg was observed 
in the nest. On 20 June, a third Mockingbird egg was 
present, but no Lark Sparrow egg could be located 
in the nest or on the ground near the nest. During 
this period and for several days that followed, a Lark 
Sparrow was found incubating the eggs more often 
than the Mockingbird, but the Mockingbird always 
had priority if both birds were present. A Lark Spar- 
row usually remained in the upper branches of the 
tree, if not on the nest. On 22 June, two additional 
eggs had been laid in the nest by the Mockingbird 
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(one was laid between 1000 and 1610). On 25 June, 
a Lark Sparrow was heard vocalizing in the upper 
branches of the tree but was not seen incubating the 
eggs even when the Mockingbird was absent. By 29 
June, the sparrows had disappeared. On 2 July the 
Mockingbird sat on the nest for longer periods than 
had been previously noted and did not move more 
than 3 m away from the nest. It is not known whether 
or not the eggs hatched, because on 9 July the nest 
was empty, perhaps the result of predation. 

Based on comparisons of size and composition of 
this nest with other Lark Sparrow and Mockingbird 
nests in the area, it appeared that the base of this 
nest was built by a Mockingbird but that the cup 
was built by a Lark Sparrow. Typical Lark Sparrow 

nests in this area average 3.7 cm inner cup diameter 
and are composed primarily of Evax species stems 
and horse hair or small rootlets. Those of Mocking- 
birds average 7.9 cm inner cup diameter. The study 
nest had an inner cup diameter of 4.5 cm and was 
composed of cedar and greenbriar stems and a small 
amount of Evax spp. 
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